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Abstract: How happy students are at school is a relatively recent question 
in the public area. Using a sample included students enrolled in secondary 
education, our study aims to analyze the relationships between school 
climate, well being and resilience. The results show that the participants with 
higher well-being and resilience report a favorable school climate, and the 
boys report higher well being compared to girls, and girls more seek novelty. 
Cluster analysis indicates the following sets of the variables: Emotions, 
Openness and Learning support. The findings may be useful to school 
counselors in implementing interventions focused on positive consequences 
of the school climate on the students’ satisfaction with their school life. 
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1. Introduction 

 
How happy students are at school and what is the roles of the school in protecting 

pupils' health are two relatively recent questions in the public area, and dedicated research 
is scarce. For many years, the objective of the school has been the effectiveness, followed 
by decrease violence and in latest trend – the focus is on the wellbeing (Blaya, 2006). The 
school climate is a psychological and sociological construct from both individuals’ 
behaviours and the subjective and collective perception of the learning environment 
(Blaya, 2006; Cohen, McCabe, Michelli, & Pickeral, 2009). The interest of research on 
school climate is explained by their consequences on the school persistence and 
achievement (Galand, Hospel & Baudoin, 2012), on bullying that affect both the involved 
individuals and the whole school community, on the mental health and wellbeing 
(Aldridge, & Ala’i, 2013; Seligman, 2011) or students’ life satisfaction (Suldo, Thalji-
Raitano, Hasemeyer, Gelley, & Hoy, 2013). Achieving both educational goals and pupils' 
well-being is the new finality of contemporary school. 
 
1.1. Literature Revue  

 
Consensus on the definition of well-being is limited, but it is almost unanimous that it 

indicates the presence of positive emotions and the absence of mental health disorder 
(AIHW, 2012). Well-being has been described as a fundamental quality of life and 
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productivity of individuals, families, communities and nations, associated with tendency 
to be proactive and creative. The Australian Institute of Health and Welfare (AIHW, 
2012) addresses well-being in line with the Bronfenbrenner and Morris (2007) 
environmental model of human development as an interaction of the individual with a 
particular environment. The well-subjective, as it results from its name, does not contain 
the same dimensions for each individual, being perceived and interpreted based on the 
person's perception of his own life, on the events he or she meets. The wellbeing is 
defined as the equilibrium point between the individual's resource and the challenging 
events of his life (Dodge, Daly, Huyton, & Sanders, 2012). However, part of the variance 
in well-being can be attributed to environmental factors, school and work conditions 
(Diener, Lucas, & Scollon, 2006). Some studies have shown that pupils who have been 
victims of violence have been declared to be generally single and unhappy (Kochenderfer 
& Ladd, 1996), which has been associated with the development of psychopathology 
(Ronning, Handegard, Sourander, & Morch, 2004) would be loss of self-esteem, anxiety 
and depression (Peterson, Ruch, Beermann, Park, & Seligman, 2007; Seligman, 2011). 

The term resilience refers to the ability to cope with difficulties and to achieve goals 
despite existing obstacles, which reflects good outcomes in the presence of major 
difficulties (Masten, 2007) and predicts low levels of stress (Hjemdal, Vogel, Solem,  
Hagen, & Stiles, 2011). High resilience is associated with high school outcomes, and this 
connection has directed some researchers to differentiate between psychological 
resilience and educational resilience. This approach of the concept resilience highlights 
the existence of personal protective features (Bernard, 2004; Zimmerman, 2013): high 
self-esteem, an internal localization of control, optimism, high social skills, high 
academic intelligence, capacity to problem solving, autonomy, purpose in life (the 
protective factors model). On the other hand, this approach highlights the existence of 
risk factors such as poverty, close-range violence, and reduced family and community 
resources. In the school environment, the educational / academic resilience is defined as 
the characteristic of students who achieve high school performance in the presence of 
high risks: adversity, low socio-economic status, family conflicts (Alva, 1991; 
Zimmerman, 2013). We mention that there are other approaches to academic resilience, 
as self-reported trait (Anghel, 2015). 

Past studies that analyzed the influence of the school climate on resilience maintain that 
in schools that strengthen students' resilience, there are supportive relationships 
between schools actors, higher academic and social expectations, opportunities for 
significant student participation in school life. Relationships with pro-social individuals, 
clear and profound relationships and the teaching-learning of life skills reinforce 
resilience (Bernard, 2004). A relatively recent study carried out on the Romanian urban 
population shows that psychological resilience is lower for pupils with low marks and 
many absences, compared to students who rarely absent and have higher grades, except 
for the novelty seeking scale (Anghel, 2015). The cited author shows that 70.5% of 
adolescents participant are exposed to high risk levels. 

The two constructs, school climate and resilience, have been studied in parallel, but 
their related analysis can bring new information on the reciprocal interactions, but in the 
psychological literature, there are few studies examining the conjugate of the two 
constructs. All dimensions of the school climate are related to the well-being of students: 
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these associations are direct on teacher support and connection to school, affiliation but 
are mediated by resilience and other traits such as ethnic and moral identity and life 
satisfaction (Aldridge et al., 2013). Research has shown that a positive climate is 
associated with well-being, increase motivation for learning (Eccles et al., 2011) decrease 
the violence (Cocoradă & Clinciu, 2009), develops the ability to respond to challenges 
and find solutions. Safety at school and colleagues' support, as positive facets of the 
climate, are predictors of pupils' well-being (Thapa, Cohen, Higgins-D'Alessandro, 2013).  

Adolescence is recognized as a period of challenges and risks, a period marked by 
academic and relational stress that strongly demands the adaptability of the individual. 
This period become it self a risk factor through hormonal changes, the transition to a new 
educational cycle with higher standards than previous cycles (Cunningham & Swanson, 
2010; Oshio, Kaneko, Nagamine, & Nakaya, 2003). Also more adolescents need high 
resilience and their wellbeing is threatened. This research use as theoretical frame the 
cultural-ecologic model witch support that the relationships between personal traits and 
various environments (culture, school climate, and family) are integrated and establish 
mutual relations of influence (Bronfenbrenner & Morris, 2007).  

 
1.2 Objectives and Hypotheses 
 

Our study aims to examine and better understand the relationships between students’ 
well being, resilience and their perception on school climate. The hypotheses of this 
quantitative study were: H1. There are gender differences in well-being and psychological 
resilience; H2. A favorable perception of the school climate is associated with well-being 
and high resilience; H3. The high performances of the students are directly associated with 
the state of well-being and psychological resilience; and H4. Resilience, pupils' well-being 
and school climate perception form clusters.  

 
2. Material and Methods  
 

The analyses presented in this paper are based on data collected on the 303 students in 
secondary education, enrolled in four schools, high school (9th - 12th grade) and middle 
school (7th and 8th grade). The sampling was based on a two steps procedure: first are 
selected the schools, second, the classes in each school. The sample includes 50.7 % girls 
and 49.3% bois, 60.7% enrolled in the middle school. All questionnaires were 
administered in a paper-pencil format, during courses, after obtaining the informed 
consent of both the principal of school and the participants. The participation was 
voluntary and unpaid. In our sample, parents of disadvantaged pupils have secondary 
education and low-level occupations (unemployed, housewives, unskilled workers, 
commerce workers), while parents advantaged students have higher education and 
intellectual occupations. 

The tools used have been demonstrated to have good reliability and validity in our 
research and previous studies. School climate questionnaire (Orzea, 2016) has 72 items, 
grouped in 7 factors: Student affiliation with school, Inter-college student relationships, 
Teacher-student relationships, School leadership, Order / Security / discipline, School 
enrollment, Teacher engagement. Correlations between the factors are weak or moderate 
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(between 0.39 and .54), the internal consistency is acceptable, Cronbach alpha 
coefficients being between .74 and .85, and 0.94 for the global climate. Adolescents 
Wellbeing Scale (AWS), developed by Birleson (1980), is a self-reported scale that 
relates to different aspects of adolescent life, and how they feel about them. Having a 
one-factor structure, the AWS includes 18 items, with alpha Cronbach .77. We chose a 
scoring way where high scores indicate high well-being, and low scores show negative 
emotions. Adolescent Resilience Scale (ARS), developed by Oshio et al. (2003), has 21 
items, grouped into three subclasses: Novelty Seeking (7 items, alpha Cronbach -72), 
Emotional Regulation (9 items, alpha Cronbach – 054), and Positive Future Orientation 
(5 items, alpha Cronbach .76). For entire scale, alpha Cronbach is .81. The Socio-
demographic Questionnaire requested data on the level of studies and occupation of 
parents, number of siblings, school performance, school, class, and gender. Based on 
studies and occupation of parents we calculated the index of socio-economic status (SES). 

 
3. Results  
 

Means, standard deviations, and correlations between the variables are presented in 
Table 1. The majority of students reported a high level of wellbeing (96.5% - score higher 
than 1.5 on the 3 point scale) and a high level of resilience (98% score higher than 2.5 on 
the 5 point scale). Differences between boys and girls are statistically significant only for 
Novelty Seeking (t = 2.68, p <.01, girls having a higher average score and week standard 
deviation, and for wellbeing (t = 3.68, p <.001), boys are a higher average score and week 
standard deviation. Regarding the SES, 27.9% of the participants are disadvantaged (in 
the bottom quarter), and the 26% are advantaged (in the top quarter).  

Well-being is positively associated only with student-student relationships, teacher-
student relationships, students and teachers school implication and global climate (Table 
1), and resilience is positively and significantly associated with all investigated variables 
(Table 1). The data support the hypothesis that the global school climate is associated 
with all variables investigated, and correlation coefficients are statistically significant. 
Wellbeing is associated with resilience and its subscales, the coefficients, statistically 
significant, being between .19 and .25 except Emotional Regulation. 

In the Pisa Results (2015), is highlighted that the SES family index is associated with 
school performances, an expected finding. According with data’ processing in PISA 
2105, we have determined the educational resilience, with an objective measure. The 
resilient students in this approach are the students who obtain higher performances than 
those predicted by the SES. ‘A student is classified as resilient if he or she is in the 
bottom quarter of the PISA index of economic, social and cultural status in the country / 
economy of assessment and still performs in the top quarter of students among all 
countries after taking their socio-economic status into account’ (OCDE, 2015, p. 230). 
Using this method to determine educational resilience, 15.3% of participants who are 
socio-economically disadvantaged and have very good grades (in top quartiles, over 
percentile 90) were identified in our study. School performance depending on resilience’ 
categories are different (p between .007 and .001), level of performance being lower on 
the students with lower level of resilience. Additionally, differences between groups 
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regarding school performance are higher that differences within groups (F = 9.53, 
p<.001).  

 
Descriptive statistics and correlation concerning the variables of the study    Table 1 

Variables M SD 
Pearson correlations 

1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13 

1 Belonging  
at school 3.2 .7 1             

2 Students’ 
relationships 4.1 .7 .37** 1            

3 Teachers-
students 
relationships 

4.1 .7 .64** .38** 1           

4 Leadership 3.8 .9 .52** .20* .59** 1          

5 Safety/ 
security/ 
discipline 

3.8 .8 .46** .43* .53** .39** 1         

6 Students 
school 
implication 

3.9 .6 .61** .42* .55** .52** .46** 1        

7 Teachers 
school 
implication 

3.8 .7 .64** .35* .76** .75** .50** .66** 1       

8 Global 
climate 26.9 4.0 .63 .75 .78 .73 .55 .74 .84 1      

9 Wellbeing 2.5 .2 .12 .25** .16* .14* .11 .16* .19** .21** 1     
10 Novelty  
Seeking 4.1 .6 .29** .38** .24** .16* .23** .36** .26** .36** .37** 1    

11 Emotional 
Regulation 3.1 .5 .18* .26** .1 -.03 .1 .21** .08 .17* .08 .72** 1   

12 Positive 
Future 
Orientation 

4.2 .6 .21** .28** .21** .19** .23** .24** .28** .31** .42** .73** .16* 1  

13 
Adolescent 
Resilience 
total 

3.7 .4 .27** .29** .22** .19** .16* .39** .21** .32** .31** .75** .45** .33** 1 

14. Index of 
SES - - .17* .02 -.35** -22** -.07 -.01 -.24** -.22** .19** .11 .08 .10 .07 

 
To test the latter hypothesis, we have run a hierarchical cluster analysis using the 

Ward's method (Yim, & Ramdeen, 2015). The dendrograme groups the dimensions of the 
school climate with the state of well-being and the resilience subscales, all variables 
being continuous, transformed into z-scores. 
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Figure 1 shows the presence of several clusters, grouped in 3 sets: (1) The Emotions, 
cluster including Belonging at school-F1, Emotional regulation and Students-students 
relations-F2; (2) The Openness consists of Wellbeing, Novelty Seeking and Positive 
Orientation towards the Future, witch  merges with the cluster (3) Support to Learning / 
School care, resulting from the grouping of Students school involvement-F6, Teachers 
school involvement-F7, Teachers-students relationships-F3, Leadership-F4, and Safety 
Climate-F5. Using the average linkage method, the clusters are identical. 
 

 
 

Fig. 1. Dendrograme using the Ward’s Method 
 

 
3. Conclusions and Discussion 

 
This study aims to examine the relationship between well-being, resilience and school 

climate in secondary school students. A very large number of students report levels at 
least average of well-being and resilience. The data partially support our assumptions. 
Differences between boys and girls are statistically significant only for novelty seeking, 
more on girls, while the state of well-being is higher for boys. Resilience studies show 
dissimilar results: thus, some claim that girls are more resilient (DuMont, Widom, & 
Czaja, 2007), others identify higher levels of resilience in boys sub-sample (Tusaie, 
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Puskar & Sereika, 2007). In our study, wellbeing is higher on boys that have more 
resources than challenges, confirming past findings (e.g., Dodge et al., 2012). 

Students who are happy at school perceive the climate as favorable, but the most 
significant associations are related to relationships with students-students relationships, 
teachers-students relationships, students and teachers school implication. The data 
confirm the explanations that consider the well-being connected on the student's social 
relationships system (Burke, 2014). A recent study (Aldridge, et al., 2015) shows that 
well-being is associated with a more favorable perception of all aspects of the school 
climate, result confirmed by our investigation. Good emotional regulation ability, novelty 
seeking, and a positive direction towards students' future are accompanied by high well-
being and favorable perceptions of the climate. Our data also support the hypothesis on 
the association of the global school climate with all the variables investigated, being 
convergent with a survey carried out on an urban sample (Anghel, 2015).  

In our study, wellbeing is directly associated with resilience, confirming other studies 
(Aldridge et al., 2015). A healthy, open school environment based on shared norms and 
close social relationships are reported by students who live a higher well being, are able 
to adjust their emotions, project their future and are receptive to novelty. Surprisingly, 
Safe / security / discipline in school do not correlate with the well-being of students.  

In recent investigation of PISA, conducted on 15-16 year old students, the Romanian 
academic resilient students are 11%, well below the OECD average (Pisa 2015, p. 223). 
In the present study, it exists a similar group, representing 15% of the entire sample, 
under the PISA global average, but over the same Romanian average. Although school 
reproduces SES patterns, small marks do not directly result from a low SES because 
school distributes resources to some disadvantaged students (Downey & Condron, 2016) 
or the students’ are strong personality traits. As Bourdieu and Passeron states (1977), 
schools might reproduce some inequalities, but they could also compensate them for 
others as socio-economic disparities in cognitive skills (Downey, & Condron, 2016). 

According to cultural-ecological model, the personal and environmental variables (well-
being and resilience, respectively, and the school climate dimensions) were grouped into 
three sets. The Emotions cluster includes similar variables, affectively marked. The sub-
set called Openness includes positive future orientation, the novelty of seeking and 
wellbeing, who the wellbeing can facilitate students' response to the major demands of 
the school. These findings are convergent with past research that found wellbeing as a 
source for energy (Gailliot, 2012), embedded with the relationships (e.g. Burke, 2014). 
Subsection Learning support / School care includes more aspects of school climate and 
confirm the close relationships between the environmental and personal factors 
(Seligman, 2011; Zimmerman, 2013). 

These findings may be used with caution because the sample is small and selected from 
one city. In addition, it was not possible to know exactly how the students interpreted the 
terms used in questionnaires. Future research can be focused on differentiate resilient 
students from disadvantaged student or non-resilient students, introduce others variables 
important in the academic field, extend the sample, compare the schools advantaged and 
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non advantaged and their climates. Compare the academic resilience and self reported 
resilience can be other attractive goal. 

The present study provides empirical evidence about the connection between school 
climate, wellbeing and resilience in secondary education, a theme more debated latest 
years. The findings suggest many novel hypotheses, and can be a starting point for others 
researches. They may be too useful to school counselors in implementing interventions 
focused on positive consequences of the school climate, on the students’ satisfaction with 
their school life, or to improve academic resilience and wellbeing. 

 
Other information may be obtained from the address: elena.cocorada@unitbv.ro   
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