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1.  Entrepreneurship as a Study Field 
 
 The entrepreneurial behaviour has been considered to be an engine of economic and 
social development ever since Max Weber (1934), for whom ‘the entrepreneurial spirit’ 
was the direct result of the education derived from protestant ethics. Psychologists such 
as McClelland (1961) or Furnham (1990) developed this idea and looked for the 
determinants of entrepreneurial behaviour in the personality features modelled by 
protestant ethics. In a country such as Romania, where, for five decades, people were 
educated to consider entrepreneurship as a manifestation of dishonesty (the label of 
‘black marketer’ was attached to the ones who tried to start what today we would call 
‘small business’) under the circumstances of a society which forbade and punished such 
behaviour, the entrepreneurial spirit was blamed as being capitalist, suspect and a threat 
to the communist social order. After the 1989 Revolution, the mentalities started to 
change with the development of the private economic sector and with the apparition of a 
new social category—the businessmen.  
 The promotion of entrepreneurship started to be considered a priority in many 
countries, including Romania, due to the fact that, as Max Weber, McClelland (1961) and 
others sustained, it is a factor of economic development and a source of national wealth, 
as it creates jobs in different activity sectors and includes some disadvantaged social 
categories, such as different types of minorities, including women.  
 Entrepreneurship is relatively recent as a research domain, the first researches being 
mentioned in the 70’s, present mostly in western countries, in faculties which offered 
specialisations in business administration. The entrepreneurship courses were initiated, 
however, long before that, after World War II (Cooper, 2005). Due to the multiplication 
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of the research issue, journals, specialised conferences and research institutes appeared, 
and the domain has known a rapid growth in the last 30 years. 
 Entrepreneurship knows very diverse conceptual approaches, from economics, to 
management, sociology and finally psychology. The researches in the economic and 
management domains attempt to describe and explain the particularities of SME’s (small 
and medium-size enterprises, presently considered a prototype for entrepreneurship, 
although all big companies started as SME’s, initiated by one or more businessmen), the 
contribution that they bring to national wealth, the logistic and management aspects 
which running a business entail. While sociology studies the influence of social factors 
(values, norms, rules) in determining entrepreneurial behaviour, the psychological 
approach, which is relatively recent, aims at identifying the personality aspects of the 
businessmen and the psychosocial correlates of this type of behaviour. 
 Ever since 1985, Gartner noted that research in the domain of entrepreneurship is 
extremely heterogeneous and these different approaches lead to a diversity of theoretical 
models which could be reconciled through interdisciplinary research. Ireland and Webb 
(2007) conducted a trans-disciplinary exploration of entrepreneurial research and came to 
the conclusion that the main disciplinary approaches pertain to the economic 
disciplines—accountability, management, finance, marketing, but that there is a large 
number of researches from the perspective of political science, anthropology, sociology 
and psychology.  
 Bringing together a series of definitions of entrepreneurship, Chell (2008) observes that 
most of the definitions are centred on the process of development of an organisation of 
any type (in business, in the social domain), more precisely on the road from an idea, 
from the perception of an opportunity, to the development of an activity which brings 
profit (pp. 2-3). The main characteristics of the process are connected to the social and 
economic context where the organisation of an innovative, productive activity, which 
brings material, financial, human and social resources, takes place and risks are taken. 
The above mentioned definitions are given rather from a managerial perspective than 
from a psychological one. 
 Ardichvili, Cardozo & Ray (2003) note that, given the diversity of approaches, from the 
analysis of the concepts used in articles from different specialty journals result a 
multitude of concepts which are not very well articulated, resulting in numerous concept 
overlaps. In their treaty on the research in the domain of entrepreneurship, Acs and 
Andretsch (2005) present an interdisciplinary synthesis of the approaches: 
entrepreneurship as a process, the exploration of opportunities, the emergence of new 
organisations, the financial aspects, the social context, the impact of entrepreneurship on 
the economic growth, the public policies. The psychological approach of the 
entrepreneurial phenomenon is included in the dimension ‘social context’ 
 
2.  Who or what is an Entrepreneur?  
 
 One of the delimitation issues of the psychological perspective on entrepreneurship is 
the signification attached to the term of entrepreneur and to the term of entrepreneurial 
behaviour. What is, in fact, an entrepreneur? A person running small business and having 
the status of legal person? A person who runs a micro-company where at least one more 
person is hired? A family member who creates business where only family members are 
involved (the case of most independent agriculture producers)? A company owner who 
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developed the business from scratch and kept it running in spite of the difficulties on the 
market? Who could be considered the prototype of the entrepreneur?  Steve Jobs, who not 
only created successful business, but also became a media star, the modest owner of a 
production company who advertises his business on the internet, the psychologist who 
opens a psychology cabinet and subscribed to LinkedIn, the plumber who advertises his 
work by putting flyers in the mailbox? 
 The definitions in the literature from the economic domain and from the social sciences 
domain vary from entrepreneur as the initiator of SME’s (business) which brings value 
and creates new jobs, to broader definitions which include business that ensure every-day 
living and where one or more members can be involved, to even legal persons (working 
as freelancers). For example, Brandstätter (2011) defines the entrepreneur as the ‘founder 
who manages his own small businesses'. 
 
3.  What is Entrepreneurial Personality? 
 
 The answers to the question are different: while the economic approach looks for 
explanations of the entrepreneurial behaviour and of the performance of a company in 
economic factors, while the psychological approach tries to identify the dispositional 
variables which differ the individuals sharing the same socio-economic context, at 
behavioural level. Under these circumstances, some individuals act business-wise, while 
others do not. Some dispositional factors, the personality traits, which have causal role in 
relation to behaviour, are partly held responsible for this. Are entrepreneurs different 
from the rest of the population due to stable internal characteristics equivalent to the 
personality traits? Could we talk about an entrepreneurial personality? 
 Among the internal determinants of entrepreneurial behaviour, the personality features 
constitute a research domain which is apparently very promising, starting from the need 
for achievement, considered by McClelland (1961) as being inextricably connected to the 
enterprising behaviour and continuing with Holland’s enterprising personality (1985). 
Nonetheless, this approach of the entrepreneurial behaviour does not consider the 
contextual factors, such as the social environment, the entrepreneurial spirit as a relevant 
element of the local culture, the technological aspects which favour the development of a 
company, the opportunities at a given moment in the social environment (such as the 
development of the service sector), the social network in which the individual functions, 
the social support that he is given, the models to which he was exposed, the specific 
competences acquired due to education, the demographic variables. After all, it is obvious 
that not all the individuals who have entrepreneurial traits come to develop profitable 
business. Maybe the explanation is found in the relation between the dispositional factors, 
which clearly make the difference, and the other demographic and contextual factors. 
 The concept of entrepreneurial personality was subject to fierce critic from social 
psychology in general and from interactionism in particular.  The main counterarguments 
for the existence of a set of time-stable, trans-situational features, valid in different 
domains of activity which could be called ‘entrepreneurial personality’ would be the 
following: different activity domains have different competence and personality 
requirements; the functioning of the individual in varied social networks in point of size 
and diversity, facilitates or, on the contrary, blocks the identification of opportunities, the 
mobilisation of resources, the successful implementation of a business idea, irrespective 
of the personality features; it is difficult to anticipate whether the same individual will act 
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according to the so-called entrepreneurial features or according to situational influences, 
in different moments and in different situations. 
 One could rather discuss on a complex person–situation interaction, which would have 
a causal role reported to the entrepreneurial behaviour. For this reason, Shaver (2005), 
considers that ‘it is surprising that the myth of entrepreneurial personality survived for so 
long’ (p. 342), given that from different other domains (especially the economic and 
management ones), the research of the entrepreneurial phenomenon was already 
implicitly oriented towards an interactionist approach. Many authors, among whom 
Llewellyn & Wilson (2003), bring into discussion the existence of an entrepreneurial 
personality, pre-existent to learning. 
 Although the characteristics of the individual who is considered an entrepreneur are 
easier to measure as compared to other variables involved in the process of creating a 
type of business, it is unfair to limit ourselves to a vision which only considers the person 
when discussing entrepreneurship. The development of business entails complex 
interactions between individual variables and variables external to the individual. Older 
psychological models of entrepreneurial activity (Gartner, 1985) suggest the integration 
of four dimensions: the characteristics of the individual who initiates the activity, the 
organisation thus created, the environment in which it functions; the process through 
which the activity is developed. Shaver and Scott (1991) suggest the consideration of the 
interaction between the person, the process and the decisions imposed by the activity, in 
other words, the cognitive processes through which the environment is interpreted and 
which lead to the behaviour per se. 
 
4.  Personality Factors and Traits Associated to Entrepreneurial Behaviour  
 
 The entrepreneurial activity has requirements which makes it different from other 
professional activities, such as the managerial activities, activities where there is 
responsibility involved for the property of the company, special requirements connected 
to seeing an opportunity and undergoing an innovative activity. There are aims, limited 
resources, few or even absent organisational coordinates, uncertainty as far as market and 
competitional evolution is concerned, decision making in risky situations, etc. In order to 
successfully face these challenges, the entrepreneur has to have personal characteristics 
different from the ones of a manager, not only at the level of domain–specific 
competences, but also at the level of personality traits, probably. 
 Tow meta-analyses conducted by Zhao & Seibert (2006) and Brandstätter (2011) 
indicates the predictive value of some personality factors measured in the Big Five model 
for the initiation of business and for its performance. When comparing the entrepreneurs 
to the managers of SME’s, their intentions and entrepreneurial performances, Brandstätter 
noted that as compared to the managers of SME’s, entrepreneurs display a lower level of 
neuroticism (N–), a high level of extraversion (E+), are more open towards experience 
(O+), display a higher level of consciensciousness (C+) and are less pleasant than 
managers (P–). Rauch & Frese (2007a) stated that the intensity of association between 
extraversion and business performance varies according to the domain of activity. A 
higher level of entrepreneurial motivation, which, according to Chan, Uy, Chernyshenko,  
Ho, & Sam (2015) explains the incremental variation of the factors from the Big Five 
model, is added to all these. 
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 It is considered that the influence of ‘general factors’ measured by Big Five is a large, 
distal one, but that there are specific features with a proximal influence, being more fit to 
be included in the definition of entrepreneurial personality: need for achievement, 
innovative spirit, proactivity, self-efficacy, tolerance to stress, autonomy, internal locus of 
control, risk propensity, tolerance to ambiguity, which differentiate the entrepreneurs 
from the managers and non-entrepreneurs  (Rauch & Frese, 2007a). 
 The need for achievement (the term was first used by H. Murray in 1938, in his theory 
on human motivation), was considered, ever since its conceptualisation by McClelland 
(1961), as a learned personality feature, involved in the orientation of the individuals 
towards activities which lead to performance, self-affirmation, social success. Given the 
fact that in the entrepreneurial activity the performances depend on the qualities of the 
individual and on his own efforts, it is expected that a high level of the need for 
achievement be associated with the orientation towards an entrepreneurial career. Among 
all the traits identified as differentiating for the entrepreneurial personality, the need for 
achievement was the most intensely studied. Recent researches (Kickul & Gundry, 2002; 
Fairlie & Holleran, 2012) indicate this trait as having a significantly higher level with 
entrepreneurs as compared to non-entrepreneurs, in association with other traits, such as 
autonomy, tolerance to ambiguity, moderate propensity towards risk, tolerance to risk. 
 The internal locus of control (concept from J. Rotter’s theory on personality, 1966), 
was considered an important feature for success in the entrepreneurial activities, due to 
the fact that the conviction that the individual himself controls the effects of his actions 
has an important motivational role in sustaining the efforts to accomplish the objectives 
under uncertainty conditions. Many researches (Begley & Boyd, 1987; Crant, 1996; 
Kickul & Gundry, 2002; Zampetakis, 2008; Altinay, Madanoglu, Daniele, & Lashley, 
2012) mention the association between the internal locus of control, the need for 
achievement and the type A behavioural pattern. 
 Risk propensity is considered an important personality feature in the initiation of 
business, because, under conditions of uncertainty specific to the entrepreneurial activity, 
the people who are predisposed to avoid risk will ruminate and will postpone decision 
making and taking action, missing opportunities and staying in a comfort zone which is 
not at all favourable to development. The initiation of business is only the beginning of a 
long interaction process between the individual characteristics, considered stable in time, 
and the socio-economic environment, which varies in situations, where there are risks 
which have to be taken, and successful business entails primarily surviving. Risk 
propensity, for example is positively associated with the entrepreneurial intention and 
negatively associated with the business performance, expressed in terms of survival and 
economic success (Zhao, Seibert & Lumpkin, 2010). A high level of risk propensity is 
rather associated to giving up on the business (Xu & Ruef, 2004; Caliendo, Fossen & 
Kriticos, 2010). Brandstätter (2011) states that risk propensity plays a mediator role 
between the personality variables such as tolerance of ambiguity, innovative spirit, need 
for achievement and family tradition. 
 Chell (2008) highlights the fact that the common core of many researches from the last 
decades is the Big Three of entrepreneurship, a set of three features considered as 
defining for entrepreneurial personality—high need for achievement, internal locus of 
control and moderate risk propensity (presented above). However, the researches were 
not limited to these variables, but included other personality traits considered to be 
associated with entrepreneurial behaviour. 

http://www.sciencedirect.com/science?_ob=RedirectURL&_method=outwardLink&_partnerName=27983&_origin=article&_zone=art_page&_linkType=scopusAuthorDocuments&_targetURL=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.scopus.com%2Fscopus%2Finward%2Fauthor.url%3FpartnerID%3D10%26rel%3D3.0.0%26sortField%3Dcited%26sortOrder%3Dasc%26author%3DBegley,%2520Thomas%2520M.%26authorID%3D7005073561%26md5%3Db18a7d7acefdb63b8cae179f75a640f7&_acct=C000064539&_version=1&_userid=4714087&md5=59e143809d1ec3a24f3a5a70978f4962
http://www.sciencedirect.com/science?_ob=RedirectURL&_method=outwardLink&_partnerName=27983&_origin=article&_zone=art_page&_linkType=scopusAuthorDocuments&_targetURL=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.scopus.com%2Fscopus%2Finward%2Fauthor.url%3FpartnerID%3D10%26rel%3D3.0.0%26sortField%3Dcited%26sortOrder%3Dasc%26author%3DBoyd,%2520David%2520P.%26authorID%3D7202871302%26md5%3Dbaa03b3a4cf511cb5364c0fea65f9fa4&_acct=C000064539&_version=1&_userid=4714087&md5=74c0e342f5d31b407fee3a79783edcf1
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 Proactivity (Crant, 2000). The state of permanent alert for the identification of some 
opportunities which could be exploited by initiating business entails a structural 
predisposition of taking initiative. The concept of proactivity, initially brought forward by 
Bateman and Crant (1993) in order to explain the individual differences as far as 
organisational behaviour was concerned, was extended to the domain of entrepreneurship 
because, in an independent activity of starting business from scratch, this predisposition 
makes the difference between waiting, answering requests and solving current issues, or 
actively looking for new opportunities. 
 Creativity and innovation are indispensable for the identification of opportunities and 
the offering of new solutions which should ensure the differentiation of one’s product 
from the product of the competition, or to identify a niche where the business should be 
successful (Ward, 2005; Weitzel, Urbig, Desai, Sanders & Acs, 2010). To these traits are 
added the intuitive cognitive style, entrepreneurial self-efficacy and entrepreneurial 
intentions (Barbosa, Gerhardt & Kickul, 2007; Prodan & Drnovsek, 2010), respectively 
independence and autonomy (Fisher & Koch, 2008). 
 Emotional intelligence was considered a compulsory personality trait for the activities 
which entail the interaction with other people and understanding them. Although there is 
an association between entrepreneurial behaviour, success in business and emotional 
intelligence, the relation is not very intense, Ahmetoglu, Leutner & Chamorro-Premuzic 
(2011) considering that the size of the effect is not concluding enough in this case.  
 The Passion for entrepreneurship, a concept introduced by Cardon, Gregoire, Stevens, 
& Patel (2013), delimits a specific motivational factor from the category of 
entrepreneurial interests, having four dimensions specific to the domain: the innovation, 
foundation and development of a company to which is added the central character of the 
entrepreneurial activity reported to the self-identity of the individual. The passion for 
entrepreneurship entails living positive affective experiences towards one’s own activity. 
The concept partially overlaps entrepreneurial motivation, which is broader.  
 Ireland & Web (2007) state that the entrepreneurial traits which ensure success could 
differ from one domain of activity to another and it is therefore difficult to delimit a type 
of personality with an acceptable degree of generality. 
 Rauch and Freese (2007b) suggests an explanation of entrepreneurial behaviour defined 
as the creation of business and ensurance of its success starting from large personality 
traits, as they are proposed in the Big Five model (Costa & McCrae, 1992) which 
influence on the one hand specific personality features such as the need of achievement, 
risk taking, the innovative spirit, autonomy, internal locus of control, self-efficacy, and on 
the other hand the way in which the knowledge, aptitudes and abilities, which in their 
turn, influence the life vision of the individual and the stating of his development 
objectives, are managed. The authors highlight a distinction which is imposed between 
the studied personality traits: the large ones, such as the personality factors measured by 
Big Five, influence the behaviour and success in entrepreneurial activities through 
specific traits. In the model proposed by the authors, other individual variables are 
included (knowledge, aptitudes, abilities), as well as variables which pertain to the social 
environment (domain of activity, organisational differences and life cycle of the 
individual) and influence (proximally) both the setting of development aims and their 
transposition into business and its success (p. 47). Older studies, such as the one of 
Begley and Boyd (1987) mention a ‘threshold effect’ for most specific traits: up to a 
point, the economic performances of the company are positively associated with the level 
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of traits but, beyond this optimal point, a too high level of the trait becomes dysfunctional 
and is associated with low levels of performance. Recent works, such as the one of 
Leutner, Ahmetoglu, Akhtar & Chamorro-Premuzic (2014) suggest that the 
entrepreneurial traits with a lower degree of generality are better predictors of the 
entrepreneurial behaviour than large personality factors. 
 One of the questions deriving from the existence of entrepreneurial traits, considered to 
be evidence as far as individual differences are concerned, is whether these are learned or 
native traits. The answer to this question has larger implications, due to the social stakes, 
related especially to education and social policies. McClelland (1961) is in favour of 
learned traits: the traits are the result of the internalisation of values, norms and 
behavioural models furnished by a certain culture in a given psychosocial context. Chell 
(2008) considers that the entrepreneurial spirit is rather a social construct. Social factors 
which are related to the proximal environment of the individual and which contribute to 
the entrepreneurial success, such as the social capital and the social network to which he 
belongs (Ulhøi, 2005) are added to the entrepreneurial personality traits. 
 Many researches identify group differences between entrepreneurs and non-
entrepreneurs at the level of personality traits, but since there is no data on the personality 
of the subjects before being or not being entrepreneurs, it is difficult to determine if they 
got to be entrepreneurs because they had entrepreneurial traits or if they acquired these 
traits while working as entrepreneurs (Chell, 2008, p. 92). Fisher & Koch (2008) sustain 
that these features are native, while others (Nicolaou & Shane, 2010; Zhang, Zyphur, 
Narayanan, Arvey, Chaturvedi, Avolio, Lichtenstein, & Larsson, 2009) assert that there is 
a broader native tendency to become a freelancer or an entrepreneur. 
 Among the demographic variables associated with entrepreneurial behaviour, gender 
seems to operate a clear selection: most established entrepreneurs are male, and the 
entrepreneurial interests of the females are more reduced as group average in most 
cultures (Wang & Wong, 2004; Gupta & Bhawe, 2007). Females see themselves as less 
skilled with business and are less tolerant towards risk taking (Verheul, Thurik, Grilo, & 
van der Zwan, 2012). The discussion of the nature of gender differences oscillates 
between the hormonal and the cultural perspective. In the first approach, the explanation 
of the fact that men are more fit for business is given reported to the level of testosterone, 
which mediates, through risk propensity, the interest for professional activities which 
presuppose initiative, combative spirit and taking risks in decision making (White, 
Thornhill & Hampson, 2006; White, Thornhill & Hampson, 2007). In the cultural 
approach, the explanation of the gender differences concerning the entrepreneurial 
interests is given by the differentiated education of the two sexes and by the values and 
social norms which favour entrepreneurial behaviour with men, but discourages it with 
women. 
 Doing research in the field of entrepreneurial personality not only contributes to the 
sound explanation of the entrepreneurial behaviour, but also clarifies the nature of some 
individual and group differences. Knowing the importance of entrepreneurial traits in 
determining the individual’s behaviour helps, on the first hand, enhancing the content of 
entrepreneurial education, starting with the school age. On the second hand, studying the 
interaction between the personality traits and the demographic and situational factors can 
contribute to the design of educational and economic policies that can contribute to the 
changes of mentalities mainly in a country in need to build up and consolidate a tradition 
in entrepreneurship.  
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